NATIONAL ASSEMBLY FOR WALES

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2004 No. (W.)

NATIONAL ASSISTANCE
SERVICES, WALES

The National Assistance
(Assessment of Resources)
(Amendment)(Wales) Regulations
2004

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Order)

These regulations make further amendments to the
National Assistance (Assessment of Resources)
Regulations 1992 (“the Principal Regulations™).

The Principal Regulations concern the assessment of
the ability of a person (“the resident”) to pay for the
accommodation arranged by local authorities under
Part III of the National Assistance Act 1948. Part III
accommodation is arranged for persons aged 18 or
over who, by reason of age, illness, disability or any
other circumstances, are in need of care and attention
which is not otherwise available to them, and for
expectant and nursing mothers in similar need.

The Principal Regulations provide that a resident shall
be assessed as able to pay for Part III accommodation
at the standard rate if that resident’s capital, calculated
in accordance with the Principal Regulations, exceeds
an upper capital limit of £20,000. These regulations
amend the Principal Regulations to increase the upper
capital limit form £20,000 to £20,500. The Principal
Regulations also provide for the calculation of a
resident’s income to take account of capital within a
band between the upper capital limit and a lower
capital limit. These Regulations amend the upper and
lower capital limits. Each £250 or part of £250 within
this band is treated as equivalent to weekly income of
£1.

Regulation 3 makes increases to the amount of Savings
Credit to be disregarded in calculating a resident’s



income. It also makes a minor amendment to remove
an unintended effect in the regulation as first enacted.

Regulation 4 amends the wording of a provision to
remove reference to further regulations (The Income
Support (General) Regulations 1987) to avoid an
amendment to the further regulations having effect in
the Principal Regulations.



STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2004 No. (W.)

NATIONAL ASSISTANCE
SERVICES, WALES

The National Assistance
(Assessment of Resources)
(Amendment)(Wales) Regulations
2004

Made
Coming into force 5™ April 2004

The National Assembly for Wales makes the following
Regulations in exercise of the powers conferred upon
the Secretary of State by section 22(5) of the National
Assistance Act 1948(1) and now vested in the National
Assembly for Wales(2).

Citation, commencement, interpretation and
application

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the
National Assistance (Assessment of
Resources)(Amendment)(Wales) Regulations 2004
and come into force on 5™ April 2004.

(2) In these regulations, “the Principal Regulations”
means the National Assistance (Assessment of
Resources) Regulations 1992(3).

(3) These Regulations apply to Wales only.

(1) 1948 c. 29; section 22(5) of the National Assistance Act 1948 was
amended by section 39(1) of and paragraph 6 of Schedule 6 to the
Ministry of Social Security Act 1966 (c.20), by section 35(2) of
and paragraph 3(b) of Schedule 7 to the Supplementary Benefits
Act 1976 (c.71), by section 20 of and paragraph 2 of Schedule 4 to
the Social Security Act 1980 (c.30), and by section 86 of
paragraph 32 of Schedule 10 to the Social Security Act 1986
(c.50).

(2) The functions of the Secretary of State under section 22(5) of the
National Assistance Act 1948 were transferred to the National
Assembly for Wales by the National Assembly for Wales
(Transfer of Functions) Order 1999 (S.1. 1999/672)

(3) S.I 1992/2977; relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1996/602,
S.I. 2002/814 (W..94) and S.1.2003/897 (W. 117).



Amendment of Principal Regulations — Capital
Limits
2.—(1) The Principal Regulations are amended in

accordance with the following paragraphs of this
regulation.

(2) In regulation 20 (Capital limit), for the figure
“£20,000”, substitute the figure “£20,500”.

(3) In regulation 28(1) (Calculation of tariff income
from capital), for the figure “£12,250”, where it
appears, substitute the figure “£13,500” and for the
figure “£20,000”, substitute the figure “£20,500”.

Amendment to Schedule 3 of the Principal
Regulations — Sums disregarded in the calculation
of income other than earnings

3. In paragraph 28H of Schedule 3 of the Principal
Regulations—

(a) replace the figure “£4.50” with the figure
“£4.75” at each place where it appears;

(b) in sub-paragraphs (3) and (4), replace the
figure “£6.75” with the figure “£6.95 at each
place where it appears;

(c) delete sub-paragraph (5) and substitute the
following sub-paragraph—

“(5) Where,

(a) the sum referred to in sub-paragraph
(4) has been disregarded in the
assessment of the resident’s partner’s
income under these Regulations, or,

(b) the partner referred to in paragraph
(4)(a) is in receipt of savings credit,

sub-paragraph (4) does not apply to the
resident.”.

Amendment of Schedule 4 of the Principal
Regulations — Capital to be disregarded

4. In Schedule 4 of the Principal Regulations, delete
paragraph 10 and substitute the following—

“10. Where the funds of a trust are derived
from a payment made in consequence of any
personal injury to the resident, the value of the
trust fund and the value of the right to receive
any payment under that trust.”

Dated
Dafydd Elis-Thomas

The Presiding Officer of the National Assembly




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.5
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /SyntheticBoldness 1.00
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /Unknown

  /Description <<
    /JPN <FEFF3053306e8a2d5b9a306f30019ad889e350cf5ea6753b50cf3092542b308030d730ea30d730ec30b9537052377528306e00200050004400460020658766f830924f5c62103059308b3068304d306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103057305f00200050004400460020658766f8306f0020004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d30678868793a3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>
    /FRA <>
    /DEU <>
    /PTB <>
    /DAN <>
    /NLD <>
    /ESP <>
    /SUO <>
    /ITA <>
    /NOR <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU <>
  >>
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [595.276 841.890]
>> setpagedevice


